




















CRISP COUNTY POWER COMMISSION 
OFFICE OF RESOURCE MANAGEMENT 

 
APPLICATION FOR A PIER PERMIT 

 
The undersigned (hereinafter called “applicant”, which term shall include the plural thereof) 
hereby makes application to the Office of the Resource Management of the Crisp County Pow-
er Commission in Crisp County, Georgia to place, within the boundaries of Lake Blackshear, a 
structure as specifically described herein, and agree to all of the terms and condition stated 
herein and to fully and promptly comply with all of the provisions, terms, specifications, and 
conditions hereof: 
 
1. Name and Address of Applicant 
 
 
 
2. Telephone Number of Applicant     Home _____________   Work ______________ 
 
 
3. Type of Facility: ______Boathouse    ______Pier    ______Boat Mooring Buoy 
 
 
    ______Float    ______Other (Specify) 
 
4. Description of the proposed structure and its purpose and intended use, including dimen-
sions and specifications. (Make a drawing of the proposed structure on the enclosed sheet en-
titled “Plan Drawing”.) 
 
5. The property where the structure is to be located is in _______________ County, in  
 
 land lot number _____________ in the ______________________ land district and is 
 
designated as subdivision lot number _________ in _________________ subdivision. 
 
6. The date on which the construction of the structure will commence is ____________, 
20______. 
 
7. The applicant agrees that said structure shall, in all respects, fully comply with the plans as 
specifically stated and described herein. The applicant shall, at all times hereunder, fully com-
ply with and abide by the pier and dock permit policy as originally adopted by the Crisp County 
Power Commission on July 28, 1981 (which is incorporated herein by reference) and all revi-
sions additions and amendments thereto. The applicant hereby acknowledges receipt of a 
copy of said pier permit policy and knowledge of the content therein. Applicant hereby author-
izes and permits any representatives of Crisp County, The Crisp County Power Commission 
and the Office of Resource Management of the Crisp County Power Commission to go upon 
any structure proposed herein along with any adjoining property, at reasonable times, for the 
purpose of examining or inspecting said structure.  
 
               
 

(over) 



 
 
8. The applicant acknowledges that any permit issued pursuant to this application will be for a 
term of five (5) years and may, in the sole discretion of the Crisp County Power Commission 
be renewed or extended. Within sixty (60) days after the expiration of any permit issued pursu-
ant hereto, unless the same is renewed or extended, or within sixty (60) days after being noti-
fied by the Crisp County Power Commission that said structure no longer complies with the 
pier permit policy, the applicant shall remove said structure at the sole expense of the appli-
cant. 
 
9. In consideration of the privilege hereby granted applicant, the applicant agrees to and does 
hereby release and agree to save and hold the County of Crisp and the Crisp County Power 
Commission harmless from any and all causes of action, suits at law or equity, or claims or de-
mands or from any liability of any nature whatsoever for or on account of any damages to per-
sons or property, including the approved facility or structure, growing out of the ownership, 
construction, operation or maintenance by the applicant of the approved facilities or structures. 
In no case shall the County of Crisp or the Crisp County Power Commission be liable for any 
damage or injury to the approved facility or structure which may be caused by or result from 
subsequent operations undertaken by the County of Crisp or the Crisp County Power Commis-
sion for the improvement of navigation or for other lawful purposes, and no claims or right to 
compensation shall accrue from any such damage. 
 
10. Applicant shall not use, maintain or construct such structure or use this permit in a manner 
which violates the terms of the pier permit policy mentioned above or in a manner which en-
dangers the health, quality, environments features, vegetation or beauty within the boundaries 
of Lake Blackshear or in a manner so as to create a nuisance or otherwise be incompatible 
with the overall recreational use of Lake Blackshear. Applicant hereby agrees that the use and 
permit hereby granted is a privilege and is subject to such orders, rules and regulations as the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission has issued or may issue under project no. 659. 
 
 
 
Dated this ______________day of _____________________, 20_______. 
 
 
 
Property Owner Signature ____________________________________________ 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 








